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Alerts

1 event
21 results matching for 'Assignments Registered' during August 2010.
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2001261633 Enhanced NGL recovery utilizing refrigeration and reflux from LNG plants 04 Aug 2010

2001269912 Direct turbine air chiller/scrubber system 04 Aug 2010

2001279880 Fungicidal composition comprising in particular an oil of vegetable origin with high
drying power

04 Aug 2010

2002216170 Targets for herbicides and transgenic plants resistant to said herbicides 04 Aug 2010

2002216257 Electrostatic application of powder material to solid dosage forms in an electric field 04 Aug 2010

2002222253 Television receiver and method of operating a server 04 Aug 2010

2002259087 A system and method for managing inventory of blood component collection 04 Aug 2010

2002259088 A system and method for managing a procedure in a blood component collection facility 04 Aug 2010

2002313983 Mutated 5-enol pyruvylshikimate3-phosphate synthase, gene coding for said protein and
transformed plants containing said gene

04 Aug 2010

2002333488 Selective herbicides based on substituted arylsulfonylaminocarbonyl triazolinones and
safeners

04 Aug 2010

2002365253 Glycoconjugate vaccines for use in immune-compromised populations 04 Aug 2010

2003229009 Network configuration evaluation 04 Aug 2010

2003234391 Peer to peer network communication with network address translation 04 Aug 2010

2003258377 Surgical scalpel with retractable guard 04 Aug 2010

2003266316 Novel 2-pyridylethylbenzamide derivative 04 Aug 2010

2004262580 N-'2-(2-pyridinyl) ethylbenzamide compounds and their use as fungicides 04 Aug 2010

2004262985 Coating of surgical devices 04 Aug 2010

2005244872 Small molecule inhibitors for MRP1 and other multidrug transporters 04 Aug 2010

2007200377 Improved Self Drive Assembly For Lawn Mowers 04 Aug 2010

2007237166 Television receiver, a server, and method of operating a server 04 Aug 2010

2007249135 Novel targets for herbicides and transgenic plants resistant to said herbicides 04 Aug 2010

http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2001261633
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2001269912
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2001279880
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002216170
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002216257
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002222253
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002259087
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002259088
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002313983
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002333488
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2002365253
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2003229009
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2003234391
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2003258377
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2003266316
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2004262580
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2004262985
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2005244872
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2007200377
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2007237166
http://www.ipmonitor.com.au/patents/case/2007249135


Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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